
  
2021 International Golf Tournament 

Treasure Lake Golf Resort, DuBois, Pennsylvania 
August 6th-8th 

 
The longer days and warmer weather brings us closer to the golf season and to 
our Slovak Catholic Sokol 66th International Golf Tournament which will be held 
August 6th-8th at Treasure Lake Golf Resort, DuBois, Pennsylvania. 
 
We are looking forward to hosting a wonderful weekend of fraternalism and 
sportsmanship. The participants and guests for the 66h International Golf 
Tournament will stay at the Fairfield Inn & Suites, Hampton Inn or at Treasure 
Lake Golf Resort. 
 
Over the years, this event has become much more than a golf outing, but has 
evolved into a true fraternal family event. Many of our Sokol members now attend 
the tournament accompanied with their respective families, which has added to 
the richness of the event and true fraternal camaraderie.  
 
We are hoping to have a large turnout of golfers and guests this year, especially 
after the cancellation of the 2020 Golf Tournament due to the COVID-19 
Pandemic. Please return your application and fee as soon as possible to my 
home address: 6 Academy Drive East, Whippany, NJ 07981. If you have any 
questions pertaining to the event, please call or text me at (973) 647-8551.  
Email jmatlon@slovakcatholicsokol.org. Application and fee deadline for the 
tournament is July 9th (postmarked).   
 
The full golf package is only $295.00 double occupancy and $415.00 single 
occupancy. The golf package includes the tournament entry fee and prize 
money, three full rounds of golf with cart, two nights lodging, including breakfast 
on Saturday and Sunday. The golf package also includes the Friday night 
hospitality and a Saturday dinner. (All taxes and gratuities are included). 
 
For our members who may not require the lodging and meal package, there is a 
golf only package for $160.00, which includes entry fee and tournament expense 
fees. The non-golf weekend package rate is $140 which includes lodging and 
breakfast if you stay at the Fairfield Inn or Hampton Inn.   
 
Each golfer must make his or her own hotel arrangements by contacting the 
Fairfield Inn and Suites at 814-371-2260 or Hampton Inn at 814-375-1000. 
 
Golf reservations for the practice round on Friday should be made with the Gold 
Course, 814-913-1482 or the Silver Course, 814-913-1480. 
 



 
 
The Friday evening Hospitality will be held outside at the Silver Course Pavilion 
at Treasure Lake. On Saturday, Luigi’s Catering will offer an early evening full 
buffet dinner that also will be served outside at the Silver Course Pavilion.  
 
This will be a great fraternal event, and we hope to see all of you at Treasure 
Lake Resort this August. St. Catherine of Siena in DuBois, Pa, has 4:30 Mass on 
Saturday afternoon. During the golf tournament all of the players and guests will 
follow the CDC guidelines in place at the time of the event for the state of 
Pennsylvania, Clearfield County and Treasure Lake Golf Resort. 
 
Entry forms may also be found on the Slovak Catholic Sokol Website 
www.slovakcatholicsokol.org under Sports Programs. 
 
Zdar Boh! 
 
James C. Matlon 
Supreme Director of Sports and Athletics 


